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Personal Development Grid  
2023 – 2024 

Year 1 

Aut 1 Aut 2 Spr 1 Spr 2 Sum 1 Sum 2 

LOTC: Geography – 
Exploring our school 
grounds and local area 
 
Visit: Geography – Local 
area walk  
 
Experience: RE – Being a 
Global Action Hero 
 
Spiritual Moment: RE – 
The wonder of creation  
 
Experience: DT Cookstars 
– vegetable biriyani  
 
Safeguarding: DT – How 
to prepare vegetables 
safely 
 
Safeguarding: Computing 
– online safety   
 
Career Aspirations: You 
could be an author 
 
British Value: PSHE 
Relationships – Mutual 
respect  
 

LOTC: History – 
playground games  
 
Experience: History – 
Reflecting on the past  
 
Visitor – History: To talk 
about toys in the past 
 
Career Aspirations: You 
could be a historian 
 
Spiritual Moment: RE – 
The wonder of the 
nativity  
 
Special Worship: Year 1 
Nativity  
 
Safeguarding: PSHE – 
Who is special to us?  
 
Experience: Art –
Evaluating art work then 
creating our own  
 
British Value: PSHE 
Relationships – Mutual 
respect  
 
Experience: Christmas 
celebrations  

LOTC: Investigating frost, 
ice and snow to link with 
reading penguin stories  
 
Experience: Self-
awareness, setting own 
targets/resolutions   
 
Visit: DT/computing – 
Class trip to Legoland  
 
Visit: RE - Virtual 
synagogue visit  
 
Visitor: PSHE/Science 
Online lesson – Our 
planet and technology  
 
Career Aspirations: You 
could be a 
conservationist  
 
Safeguarding: Safety 
rules for visits/visitors  
 
Spiritual Moment: Geog 
– The world is so big 
 
British Value: PSHE 
Wider World – 
Democracy   

LOTC: Science/RE – 
Spring walk within the 
school grounds  
 
Spiritual Moment: 
English – reflecting on 
fables and their 
meanings  
 
Charity: Comic Relief Red 
Nose Day  
 
Career Aspirations: You 
could work for a charity  
 
Visitor – History: To talk 
about our school in the 
past 
 
Experience: PSHE – 
Recognising feelings  
 
Safeguarding: PSHE – 
How do we recognise our 
feelings? 
 
British Value: PSHE 
Mental Health – 
Tolerance 
 
Experience: Easter 
celebrations 

LOTC: Maths – Position 
and direction  
 
Experience: Self-belief 
The Koala Who Could  
 
LOTC: Science – 
Identifying plants  
 
Career Aspirations: You 
could be a gardener   
 
Spiritual Moment: 
Science – the variety and 
growth of plants 
 
Visit: RE – Church visit to 
find out about Baptism  
 
Safeguarding: PSHE – 
What does healthy 
mean? 
 
Safeguarding: DT – Using 
equipment safely  
 
Experience: Geography – 
Investigating seasons  
 
British Value: PSHE 
Health – Individual 
liberty 

Experience: Considering 
special people and what 
makes them special  
 
Spiritual Moment: 
History – People who 
changed the world   
 
Experience: How to be a 
hero or a role model  
 
Safeguarding: Identifying 
suitable role models  

 
Safeguarding: PE – Using 
equipment safely  

 
Visitor – PSHE: 
Emergency services staff 
to talk about their work  
 
Career Aspirations: You 
could work for the 
emergency services   
 
British Value: PSHE 
Safety – Rule of law 
 
Experience: Moving up to 
Year 2  
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